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Prevost opens new Service Center in Houston  

Sainte-Claire, QC, February 25, 2013 – Prevost has opened a new Service 
Center in Houston, Texas. The Houston facility is a new construction building 
providing 5400 sq. ft., including a service area with two drive-through bays. The 
service center is staffed with Prevost technicians who are certified for bumper-to-
bumper maintenance and repair for all Nova Bus vehicles, and Prevost and 
Volvo Bus coaches, including Volvo engine and transmission. The facility is 
equipped with a controlled access fence, operational after hours, monitored by a 
security patrol and a video surveillance camera. The Houston Service Center is 
equipped with electrical hookups and is open Monday to Friday, 8:00am to 
5:00pm. Carl Boulet is the branch manager of the new service center and 
Theodore Bruning is the service manager. 
 
Prevost Service Center 
10155 Windfern Road 
Houston, TX 77064 
(713) 849-8562 
 
The Houston Service Center expands the Prevost Service Network, the most 
extensive service network in the industry. Other Prevost Service Centers are in 
South Plainfield, New Jersey; Jacksonville, Florida; Nashville, Tennessee; 
Dallas, Texas; Mira Loma, California; Delta, British Columbia; Fort McMurray, 
Alberta; and Quebec City, Quebec. 

About Prevost 

Prevost is a leading manufacturer of premium intercity touring coaches and the 
world leader in the production of conversion coaches for high-end motorhome 
and specialty conversion. As part of the Volvo Group, it has access to the 
financial strength, research capability, and manufacturing expertise of the group. 
The Volvo Group is one of the world’s leading manufacturers of heavy-duty 
diesel engines. Prevost has its main manufacturing facilities in Sainte-Claire, 
Quebec, Canada and has nine Parts and Service Centers located in the United 
States and Canada. www.prevostcar.com 
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